
 
 

Tier 2 Canada Research Chair in European Union Studies 
 
The Faculty of Arts and Social Sciences at Dalhousie University invites applications for a Tier 2 Canada 
Research Chair (CRC) in European Union Studies, with a tenure-stream appointment at the rank of 
Assistant Professor.  The position is open with regard to disciplinary specialization, with a primary 
appointment in one of the Faculty's 11 Departments. 
 
The successful candidate must have a PhD and an outstanding research profile for their career stage with 
an innovative and original research programme. They should be an emerging leader in advancing 
research on European Union Studies with specific interests in one or more of the following areas: health, 
trade, social cultural policy and other policy areas affecting Europe and its citizens. The ideal candidate 
will be highly motivated to pursue innovative opportunities and will be open to working in an inter-
disciplinary environment. 
 
The holder of the Chair will be expected to enhance the university’s commitment to community 
development and its relationship with government and service provider organizations and the non-
governmental sector. The Chair will also be encouraged to make connections with cross-faculty initiatives 
at the university and coordinate projects across academic and non-academic sectors to build successful 
partnerships and pursue external funding to support them. The successful candidate will have a strong 
track record of obtaining external funding; they should also have a demonstrated ability to work 
cooperatively and to provide leadership in an interdisciplinary environment, develop multi-faceted research 
projects, and work with graduate students and/or postdoctoral fellows. They also will be able to work 
closely with the Jean Monnet European Union Centre of Excellence (JMEUCE) at Dalhousie University 
and contribute to its ongoing projects and activities. 
 
Dalhousie has also long emphasized European Union Studies, having established and continuously hosted 
a JMEUCE since 2006, with funding from the European Commission. Through JMEUCE, Dalhousie is 
currently hosting a Jean Monnet Network in Health Law and Policy (2017-20) and Jean Monnet Chair in 
Public Diplomacy (2018-2021). The university is also Atlantic Canada’s leading research-intensive university 
and a driver of the region’s 

http://www.dal.ca/fass
http://www.chairs-chaires.gc.ca/program-programme/nomination-mise_en_candidature-eng.aspx#s3
http://www.chairs.gc.ca/
http://www.dal.ca/becounted/selfid


 
A complete application package for this position should include: 

¶ a cover letter (maximum of 2 pages) 

¶ a CV 

¶ a research statement (maximum of 2 pages)

http://www.dal.ca/becounted/selfid
http://www.dal.ca/policies
mailto:FASSADR@dal.ca
mailto:FASSDEAN@dal.ca

